
FA E R N
AT F

TQUO U

BERMUDA

PUBLIC TREASURY (ADMINISTRATION AND PAYMENTS) (TEMPORARY
UNEMPLOYMENT BENEFIT) (NO. 3) AMENDMENT (NO. 2)

REGULATIONS 2021

BR 58 / 2021

TABLE OF CONTENTS

Citation
Amends regulation 3
Amends regulation 4
Amends regulation 6
Amends regulation 7

The Minister of Finance, in exercise of the power conferred by section 33 of the
Public Treasury (Administration and Payments) Act 1969, makes the following Regulations:

Citation
These Regulations, which amend the Public Treasury (Administration and

Payments) (Temporary Unemployment Benefit) (No. 3) Regulations 2021 (the “principal
Regulations”), may be cited as the Public Treasury (Administration and Payments)
(Temporary Unemployment Benefit) (No. 3) Amendment (No. 2) Regulations 2021.

Amends regulation 3
The principal Regulations are amended in regulation 3(2) by deleting “three weeks”

and substituting “five weeks”.

Amends regulation 4
The principal Regulations are amended in regulation 4―

in paragraph (1), by deleting “paragraph (7)(a)” and substituting
“paragraph (7)”;

1
2
3
4
5

1

2

3

(a)

1



PUBLIC TREASURY (ADMINISTRATION AND PAYMENTS) (TEMPORARY
UNEMPLOYMENT BENEFIT) (NO. 3) AMENDMENT (NO. 2) REGULATIONS
2021

by revoking paragraph (7) and inserting the following―

For the purposes of these Regulations, “business” means a business
referred to in regulation 5(a) of the Public Health (COVID-19 Emergency Powers)
(Stay at Home) Regulations 2021 (COVID-restrictions for bars and clubs).”.

“(7)

Amends regulation 6
The principal Regulations are amended in regulation 6(2)―

by deleting “three weeks” and substituting “five weeks”;

by deleting “regulation 4(7)(a)” and substituting “regulation 4(7)”.

Amends regulation 7
The principal Regulations are amended in regulation 7(2) by deleting “30 April

2021” and substituting “15 May 2021”.

Made this 23rd day of April 2021

 

Minister of Finance

[Operative Date: 23 April 2021]

(b)

4

(a)

(b)

5

2




